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"^Ss..
as*S.Rs\.s\

GI.-L€J-l FIHoUq)I- HGLFraFIFIoLFT

T



Foster Foster
Continued ftom 7

Dearbom, Mich. in 1969, and a l-ew
other firms. His longest affiliation
came with L.E. Smith Glass in 19?0,
alld contirued ihere until the late
1990s.
Actually a desigrler by trade, Edc

deated many glass designs. An affili-
ate told him an ideal place for him to
work would be at a place known as
L.E. Smith Glass in Mount Pleasant.
Eric said the factory was ihen owned
by Tim Wible and his family.

"I was hired right away," Eric said.
"Anything that had to be done, I did
it." His tavels didn't end either, as
he went to many sites in the United
States for various glass shows.
He enjoyed his many years in the

Mouft Pleasant area, but says things
are the exact opposite of the hectic
life he previously led. That in itself
has been a blessing.

"I was so busy ullil I slowed down
after coming to Mount Pleasant. I
had to slow down... I couldn't con-

tinue at the pace I was going."
In addition to his long-time afftlia-

tion with Smith Glass, Eric has con-
tributed his insights at meetings of
fie Mount Pleasant Historical
Society.
Eric remaiE in contacf with

Baroness Kaminski, who is now 87
years of age. He rccognizes the
impact of their meeting many years
ago, when a gdeving soldier and a
woman seeking Gen. Charles De
Gaulle accidentally came upon each
other.
Indirectly, that set in motion the

sedes of events that eventuallY
brcught a young man of French and
English descent to the westem
Pennsylvania community of Mount
Pleasant.

Eric has been prcud to call Mount
Pleasant his home, and felt com-
pelled to sharc his interesting life
story with oul nany readeis.
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"I was hired right away," Eric said.
"Anything that had to be done, I did
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States for various glass shows.
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Mount Pleasant area, but says things
are the exact opposite of the hectic
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ago, when a gdeving soldier and a
woman seeking Gen. Charles De
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other.
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story with our many readeis.
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